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“Where Judgment Begins” 
“For	it	is	time	for	judgment	to	begin	at	the	household	of	God;	
and	if	it	begins	with	us,	what	will	be	the	outcome	for	those	

who	do	not	obey	the	gospel	of	God?”		(1	Peter	4:17)		
	

 
 

God’s Gracious Judgment 
Isaiah 53:4-8 – 4  “Surely he has borne our griefs and carried our sorrows; yet 
we esteemed him stricken, smitten by God, and afflicted. 5  But he was pierced 
for our transgressions; he was crushed for our iniquities; upon him was the 
chastisement that brought us peace, and with his wounds we are healed. 6  All 
we like sheep have gone astray; we have turned—every one—to his own way; 
and the LORD has laid on him the iniquity of us all. 7  He was oppressed, and 
he was afflicted, yet he opened not his mouth; like a lamb that is led to the 
slaughter, and like a sheep that before its shearers is silent, so he opened not 
his mouth. 8  By oppression and judgment he was taken away; and as for his 
generation, who considered that he was cut off out of the land of the living, 
stricken for the transgression of my people?”  
 
  
Hebrews 12:3-11 – 3  “Consider him who endured from sinners such hostility 
against himself, so that you may not grow weary or fainthearted. 4  In your 
struggle against sin you have not yet resisted to the point of shedding your 
blood. 5  And have you forgotten the exhortation that addresses you as sons? 
‘My son, do not regard lightly the discipline of the Lord, nor be weary when 
reproved by him. 6  For the Lord disciplines the one he loves, and chastises 
every son whom he receives.’ 7  It is for discipline that you have to endure. 
God is treating you as sons. For what son is there whom his father does not 
discipline? 8  If you are left without discipline, in which all have participated, 
then you are illegitimate children and not sons. 9  Besides this, we have had 
earthly fathers who disciplined us and we respected them. Shall we not much 
more be subject to the Father of spirits and live? 10  For they disciplined us for 
a short time as it seemed best to them, but he disciplines us for our good, that 
we may share his holiness. 11  For the moment all discipline seems painful 



rather than pleasant, but later it yields the peaceful fruit of righteousness to 
those who have been trained by it.”  
 
 

Self Examination 
1 Corinthians 11:31-32 – 31  “But if we judged ourselves truly, we would not be 
judged. 32  But when we are judged by the Lord, we are disciplined so that we 
may not be condemned along with the world.” 
 
2 Corinthians 13:5 – “Examine yourselves, to see whether you are in the faith. 
Test yourselves. Or do you not realize this about yourselves, that Jesus Christ 
is in you?—unless indeed you fail to meet the test!” 
 
Desiring God’s Appraisal 
Psalm 19:12-13 – 12  “Who can discern his errors?  Declare me innocent from 
hidden faults. 13  Keep back your servant also from presumptuous sins; let 
them not have dominion over me!  Then I shall be blameless, and innocent of 
great transgression.”  
 
Psalm 139:23-24 – 23  “Search me, O God, and know my heart!  Try me and 
know my thoughts! 24  And see if there be any grievous way in me, and lead me 
in the way everlasting!”  
 
 
Better Now than Later 
Mark 9:49 – “For everyone will be salted with fire.” 
 
2 Corinthians 5:9-11 – 9  “So whether we are at home or away, we make it our 
aim to please him. 10  For we must all appear before the judgment seat of 
Christ, so that each one may receive what is due for what he has done in the 
body, whether good or evil. 11 Therefore, knowing the fear of the Lord, we 
persuade others.  But what we are is known to God, and I hope it is known 
also to your conscience.”  
 
 
 
 
 

(ESV used unless otherwise noted) 

(This message is available for review and sharing at alivein.me) 


